25-61-A Underground Utility Repairs
Thursday, May 29, 2025 at 11:00 am
Items

Traffic Control - including traffic control plan

Remove and Dispose of Concrete Pavement

Replace Long service - 1-in diameter and below, up to 100 ft (50-55 ft length typ)
Replace Short Service - 1-in diameter and below, up to 25 ft (10-20 ft length typ)
Repair Fire Hydrant

Replace Fire Hydrant - Salvage old and return to Public Services Yard

Sewer Service point repair

Replace full sewer service

Replace manhole ring and cover

Point repair water main break

Spot repair Storm Drain - 24-inch diameter and below

Construct curb inlet - 5- and 10- foot

Replace top of curb inlet

Funish and install storm drain - 24-inch and below

Extra depth with shoring

Repair Leaking valve

Replace water valve - Salvage and return to Public Services Yard

Sewer mainline cleaning/flushing - 12-inch diameter and below

Sewer mainline cleaning/flushing - 15- to 21- inch diameter

Storm sewer cleaning/flushing - 24-inch diameter and below

Sewer main TVI - 12-inch diameter and below

Sewer service lateral TVI

Water service / main leak detection

Concrete replacement - Sidewalk replacement (5" thick)

Concrete replacement - 6" thick street

Concrete replacement - 8" thick street

Concrete replacement - 10" thick street

Site restoration - Includes seeding/sodding and cleanup

Erosion Protection - If needed (silt fences, filtration socks)

3 person crew - Each site

Combination Air Release Valve (Replace) - 2-inch

Install new water service - New saddle, corporation stop, and angle/curb stop (1-inch)
2-inch hot mix asphalt - Type D

Manbhole epoxy lining - Warren epoxy or approved equal

Install standard cleanout

Flowable fill

Material Markup - Additional materials as needed

Mobilize per 5 Work Orders - Includes QA QC per job (Pictures, start & comp. date)
Proctor & Density - Soil Density performed as requested

Total Cost
QuantityRequired  UnitofMeasure

12 each
10000 square foot
15 each
15 each
12 lump sum
8 lump sum
10 lump sum
500 linear feet
3 each
6 lump sum
6 lump sum
3 lump sum
20 linear feet
100 linear feet
150 linear feet
5 lump sum
3 lump sum
2500 linear feet
1500 linear feet
1000 linear feet
4000 linear feet
2500 linear feet
20 each
200 square foot
45 square yard
37 square yard
25 square yard
185 square yard
20 each
100 hour
1 each
2 each
150 square yard
25 vertical feet
2 each
250 cubicyard
0 percentage
10 each
5 each

Canary Construction, Inc.
$2,898,275.00

UnitPrice

$4,800.00
$30.00
$11,000.00
$8,000.00
$6,000.00
$15,000.00
$30,000.00
$250.00
$3,000.00
$35,000.00
$16,500.00
$12,000.00
$5,000.00
$300.00
$200.00
$6,500.00
$12,000.00
$30.00
$40.00
$50.00
$35.00
$25.00
$6,500.00
$35.00
$400.00
$450.00
$500.00
$65.00
$2,200.00
$500.00
$45,000.00
$12,000.00
$350.00
$800.00
$3,500.00
$600.00
$25.00
$7,000.00
$2,000.00

TotalCost

$57,600.00
$300,000.00
$165,000.00
$120,000.00
$72,000.00
$120,000.00
$300,000.00
$125,000.00
$9,000.00
$210,000.00
$99,000.00
$36,000.00
$100,000.00
$30,000.00
$30,000.00
$32,500.00
$36,000.00
$75,000.00
$60,000.00
$50,000.00
$140,000.00
$62,500.00
$130,000.00
$7,000.00
$18,000.00
$16,650.00
$12,500.00
$12,025.00
$44,000.00
$50,000.00
$45,000.00
$24,000.00
$52,500.00
$20,000.00
$7,000.00
$150,000.00
$0.00
$70,000.00
$10,000.00

Southern Trenchless Solutions
$1,106,897.00
TotalCost

UnitPrice

$5,000.00
$40.00
$2,885.00
$1,800.00
$9,500.00
$12,500.00
$3,500.00
$160.00
$2,500.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$15.00
No Bid
No Bid
$2.50
$3.50
$3.25
$2.00
$1.50
No Bid
No Bid
$315.00
$324.00
$360.00
No Bid
No Bid
$360.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$400
$1,250.00
$300
$20.00
$5,270.90
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

$60,000.00
$400,000.00
$43,275.00
$27,000.00
$114,000.00
$100,000.00
$35,000.00
$80,000.00
$7,500.00

$2,250.00

$6,250.00
$5,250.00
$3,250.00
$8,000.00
$3,750.00

$14,175.00
$11,988.00
$9,000.00

$36,000.00

$10,000.00
$2,500.00
$75,000.00
$0.00
$52,709.00

The Wilkins Group, Inc

$1,087,060.00
TotalCost

UnitPrice

$3,600.00

$35.00
$7,000.00
$9,000.00
$8,000.00

$26,000.00

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

$650.00

$4,400.00

$35.00
$60.00
$80.00
$100.00
$250.00

$425.00

$15.00
$2,200.00

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

$43,200.00
$350,000.00
$105,000.00
$135,000.00
$96,000.00
$208,000.00

$1,950.00

$22,000.00

$7,000.00
$2,700.00
$2,960.00
$2,500.00
$46,250.00

$42,500.00

$0.00
$22,000.00

four star excavating

$944,960.00
UnitPrice TotalCost

$7,500.00 $90,000.00
$2.00 $20,000.00
$7,800.00 $117,000.00
$6,800.00 $102,000.00
$1,500.00 $18,000.00
$7,000.00 $56,000.00
$6,500.00 $65,000.00
$90.00 $45,000.00
$2,200.00 $6,600.00
$8,000.00 $48,000.00
$6,000.00 $36,000.00
$6,000.00 $18,000.00
$200.00 $4,000.00
$120.00 $12,000.00
$100.00 $15,000.00
$2,200.00 $11,000.00
$7,200.00 $21,600.00
$3.00 $7,500.00
$5.00 $7,500.00
$4.00 $4,000.00
$2.00 $8,000.00
$2.00 $5,000.00
$300.00 $6,000.00
$12.00 $2,400.00
$120.00 $5,400.00
$130.00 $4,810.00
$150.00 $3,750.00
$10.00 $1,850.00
$200.00 $4,000.00
$575.00 $57,500.00
$7,500.00 $7,500.00
$2,200.00 $4,400.00
$100.00 $15,000.00
$250.00 $6,250.00
$1,200.00 $2,400.00
$106.00 $26,500.00
$0.00 $0.00
$7,600.00 $76,000.00
$800.00 $4,000.00
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