CHEMTRADE CHEMICALS

25-64-A Water & Wastewater Treatment Chemicals usLLC Chemrite Lhoist North America PVS DX INC Pencco, Inc. Polydyne Inc. Solenis LLC Terra Midstream/OFS
Monday, June 23, 2025 at 10am Total Cost $296,000.00 $19,600.00 $69,450.00 $1,060,475.00 $193,600.00 $100,496.00 $21,000.00 $709,439.40
Unit
Quantity of Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
Items Required Measure Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost
ACTIVATED CARBON 40 TON NoBid  NoBid NoBid  NoBid NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid  NoBid NoBid  NoBid NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid
15 TON NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid $10,800.00 $162,000.00 NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid $10,000.00 | $150,000.00
60 TON NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid NoBid  NoBid $2,175.00 NoBid  NoBid NoBid  No Bid NoBid  NoBid $2,088.99  $125,339.40
5500 GALLON NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid  No Bid $12.10 [ $66,572.00' NoBid  No Bid No Bid No Bid
14000 GALLON NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid $2.50 [$35,00000 NoBid  NoBid NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid $4  $56,000.00
13200 POUND NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid  No Bid $2.57 [11$33,924.00| NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid
800 TON $355  $284,000.00 NoBid  NoBid NoBid  No Bid No Bid No Bid $242 [$193,600.00 NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid $400  $320,000.00
10000 POUND NoBid  No Bid $1.96 | $19,600.00| NoBid  NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid $210  $21,000.00 $2.81  $28,100.00
30000 POUND $0.40 [/$12,000001 NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid $1 $30,000.00
200 TON NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid $347.25 [11$69,450.00  No Bid No Bid NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid No Bid No Bid
337 TON NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid $2,175.00 [ §732,97500 NoBid  NoBid NoBid  No Bid NoBid  No Bid No Bid No Bid
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