25-14-A Wood Fence Repair & Replacement
Monday, March 3, 2025 at 2:30pm
Iltems

Remove and replace six foot (6') high fence with posts @ 8’ span.
Remove and replace eight foot (8') high fence with posts @ 6’ span.

Remove and replace one six foot (6') by eight foot (8') panel including trim, kicker board, rails, and pickets.
Remove and replace one eight foot (8') by six foot (6') panel including trim, kicker board, rails, and pickets.

Remove and replace one six foot (6') fence post and hardware.
Remove and replace one eight foot (8') fence post and hardware.
Remove and replace one ten foot (10') fence post and hardware.
Remove and replace one twelve foot (12') fence post and hardware.
Remove one six foot (6') by eight foot (8') fence panel.

Remove one eight foot (8') by six foot (6') fence panel.

Remove and replace 4 ft chain link fence

Remove and replace 6 ft chain link fence

Remove and replace 8 ft chain link fence

Remove and replace 10 ft chain link fence

Install only 4 ft chain link fence

Install only 6 ft chain link fence

Install only 8 ft chain link fence

Install only 10 ft. chain link fence

Wash and stain existing fence

Pressure wash existing stone/brick screening wall

Total Cost
Unit
of Quantity
Measure Required

LF 500
LF 500
EA 8
EA 8
EA 9
EA 9
EA 5
EA 5
EA 2
EA 2
LF 25
LF 75
LF 75
LF 25
LF 25
LF 75
LF 25
LF 25
SQFT 1200
SQFT 6000

Fence Fanatics LLC

$128,460.00
Unit Total
Price Cost
$70  $35,000.00
$86  $43,000.00
$560 $4,480.00
$510 $4,080.00
$350 $3,150.00
$350 $3,150.00
$350 $1,750.00
$350 $1,750.00
$800 $1,600.00
$800 $1,600.00
$40 $1,000.00
$60 $4,500.00
$80 $6,000.00
$96 $2,400.00
$40 $1,000.00
$60 $4,500.00
$80 $2,000.00
$96 $2,400.00
$1.25 $1,500.00
$0.60 $3,600.00

Llano River Fence

$98,362.00
Unit Total
Price Cost

$50  $25,000.00
$58  $29,000.00
$1,150.00 $9,200.00
$1,350.00 $10,800.00
$61 $549
$67 $603
$104 $520
$112 $560
$350 $700
$350 $700
$40 $1,000.00
$42 $3,150.00
$60 $4,500.00
$78 $1,950.00
$32 $800
$36 $2,700.00
$42 $1,050.00
$48 $1,200.00
$0.90 $1,080.00
$0.55 $3,300.00

Stripped & Stained
$118,889.28

Unit
Price

$81.15
$108.37
$649.20
$866.96
$100
$150
$200
$250
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$2.50
$0.75

Total
Cost

$40,575.00
$54,185.00
$5,193.60
$6,935.68
$900
$1,350.00
$1,000.00
$1,250.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$3,000.00
$4,500.00

Triple-C Fence

$135,030.00
Unit Total
Price Cost
$62.80 $31,400.00
$68.90  $34,450.00
$680 $5,440.00
$790 $6,320.00
$345 $3,105.00
$365 $3,285.00
$425 $2,125.00
$465 $2,325.00
$550 $1,100.00
$695 $1,390.00
$42 $1,050.00
$55 $4,125.00
$58.90 $4,417.50
$85 $2,125.00
$38 $950
$55 $4,125.00
$58.90 $1,472.50
$85 $2,125.00
$3.50 $4,200.00
$3.25 $19,500.00



