CITY OF LEWISVILLE
RFP #26-23-A
MOWING & LANDSCAPING SERVICES (ZONES 4,5, 7, 8, 9)

[_cerv Landscape solutions, LLc | [_earthworks Landscape and [T | Good Earth Corp. Green World Care Inc Incircle Management SRH Land: LLC Landscape
Plano, TX | | Houston, TX | Dallas, TX Dallas, TX Colleyville, TX Dallas, TX Lewisville, TX
Committee Average
PRICE 30 273 2590 9.40 1937 22.06 13.99 1336
EQUIPMENT 30 22.50 20.25 28.00 21.75 17.25 20.75 27.00
PREVIOUS MUNICIPAL EXPERIENCE 20 2.75 14.25 17.50 1350 14.25 1525 19.00
SAFETY TRAINING PROGRAM 10 8.00 6.75 9.00 6.50 4.75 8.50 9.25
NUMBER OF DAYS TO COMPLETE A MOWING CYCLE 10 9550 325 7.75 625 350 550 850
BONUS POINTS FOR FUEL EQUIPMENT (5%, 10% OR 15%) 3.41 0.00 0.00 0.00 3.15 0.00 0.00
TOTALS 100 POINTS 68.89 70.40 7165 6737 64.96 63.99 7711
ZONE 4
PRICE 30 3000 17.51 14.90 1631 2944 10.59 0.00
EQUIPMENT 30 20.75 20.25 28.00 21.75 17.25 20.75 0.00
PREVIOUS MUNICIPAL EXPERIENCE 20 2.75 14.25 17.50 1350 14.25 1525 0.00
SAFETY TRAINING PROGRAM 10 8.00 6.75 9.00 6.50 4.75 8.50 0.00
10 950 325 7.75 625 350 550 0.00
450 000 000 000 242 000 000
100 POINTS 7550 62.01 7715 6431 7361 60.59 No Bid
ZONE 5
PRICE 30 3000 2199 15.60 1878 2593 1332 1621
EQUIPMENT 30 20.75 20.25 28.00 21.75 17.25 20.75 27.00
PREVIOUS MUNICIPAL EXPERIENCE 20 2.75 14.25 17.50 1350 14.25 1525 19.00
SAFETY TRAINING PROGRAM 10 8.00 6.75 9.00 6.50 4.75 8.50 9.25
NUMBER OF DAYS TO COMPLETE A MOWING CYCLE 10 950 325 7.75 625 350 550 850
BONUS POINTS FOR FUEL EQUIPMENT (5%, 10% OR 15%) 4.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 3.89 0.00 0.00
TOTALS 100 POINTS 7550 66.49 7785 66.78 6957 6332 79.96
30 1499 30.00 0.00 1830 1657 1511 1857
30 2075 2025 0.00 2175 17.25 2075 27.00
PREVIOUS MUNICIPAL EXPERIENCE 20 2.75 14.25 0.00 13.50 14.25 15.25 19.00
SAFETY TRAINING PROGRAM 10 8.00 6.75 0.00 6.50 475 850 925
NUMBER OF DAYS TO COMPLETE A MOWING CYCLE 10 9.50 3.25 0.00 6.25 3.50 5.50 8.50
BONUS POINTS FOR FUEL EQUIPMENT (5%, 10% OR 15%) 225 0.00 0.00 0.00 249 0.00 0.00
TOTALS 100 POINTS 58.24 7450 No Bid 6630 5881 6511 8232
30 1832 30.00 000 2518 1928 1330 1733
30 2075 2025 0.00 2175 17.25 2075 27.00
PREVIOUS MUNICIPAL EXPERIENCE 20 2.75 14.25 0.00 13.50 14.25 15.25 19.00
SAFETY TRAINING PROGRAM 10 8.00 6.75 0.00 6.50 475 850 925
NUMBER OF DAYS TO COMPLETE A MOWING CYCLE 10 9.50 3.25 0.00 6.25 3.50 5.50 8.50
BONUS POINTS FOR FUEL EQUIPMENT (5%, 10% OR 15%) 275 0.00 0.00 0.00 289 0.00 0.00
TOTALS 100 POINTS 62.07 7450 No Bid 7318 6192 6330 81,08
30 2035 30.00 000 1827 2176 958 14.07
30 2075 2025 0.00 2175 17.25 2075 27.00
PREVIOUS MUNICIPAL EXPERIENCE 20 2.75 14.25 0.00 13.50 14.25 15.25 19.00
SAFETY TRAINING PROGRAM 10 8.00 6.75 0.00 6.50 475 850 925
NUMBER OF DAYS TO COMPLETE A MOWING CYCLE 10 9.50 3.25 0.00 6.25 3.50 5.50 8.50
BONUS POINTS FOR FUEL EQUIPMENT (5%, 10% OR 15%) 3.05 0.00 0.00 0.00 326 0.00 0.00
TOTALS 100 POINTS 64.40 7450 No Bid 66.27 6477 5958 7782
No bonus points- alternative fuel
equipment s less than 10% of Bonus points for fuel = 15% of
Bonus points for fuel = 10% No bonus points No bonus points equipment list. price score No bonus points No bonus points
Markup on Materials 20% 10% 30% 10% 10% 0% 10%




	Matrix with Pricing

