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#0-1 45 Gallon Tree - Live Oak Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 906.25$     18,125.00$  595.00$       11,900.00$     780.00$     15,600.00$    775.00$    15,500.00$  610.00$    12,200.00$                     550.00$    11,000.00$  
#0-2 30 Gallon Tree - Live Oak Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 50 Each 468.75$     23,437.50$  450.00$       22,500.00$     680.00$     34,000.00$    675.00$    33,750.00$  380.00$    19,000.00$                     300.00$    15,000.00$  
#0-3 15 Gallon Tree - Live Oak Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 237.50$     4,750.00$    No Bid No Bid 490.00$     9,800.00$      575.00$    11,500.00$  235.00$    4,700.00$                       200.00$    4,000.00$    
#0-4 Tree Sapling - Live Oak '- 100 Each 50.00$       5,000.00$    7.95$           795.00$          340.00$     34,000.00$    55.00$      5,500.00$    4.75$         475.00$                          30.00$      3,000.00$    
#0-5 45 Gallon Tree - Chinquapin Oak Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 906.25$     18,125.00$  595.00$       11,900.00$     800.00$     16,000.00$    775.00$    15,500.00$  595.00$    11,900.00$                     550.00$    11,000.00$  
#0-6 30 Gallon Tree - Chinquapin Oak Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 50 Each 468.75$     23,437.50$  450.00$       22,500.00$     700.00$     35,000.00$    650.00$    32,500.00$  410.00$    20,500.00$                     300.00$    15,000.00$  
#0-7 15 Gallon Tree - Chinquapin Oak Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 237.50$     4,750.00$    No Bid No Bid 525.00$     10,500.00$    575.00$    11,500.00$  235.00$    4,700.00$                       200.00$    4,000.00$    
#0-8 Tree Sapling - Chinquapin Oak '- 100 Each 50.00$       5,000.00$    7.95$           795.00$          780.00$     78,000.00$    55.00$      5,500.00$    4.75$         475.00$                          30.00$      3,000.00$    
#0-9 45 Gallon Tree - Monterey Oak Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 906.50$     18,130.00$  No Bid No Bid 750.00$     15,000.00$    775.00$    15,500.00$  610.00$    12,200.00$                     550.00$    11,000.00$  
#0-10 30 Gallon Tree - Monterey Oak Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 50 Each 468.75$     23,437.50$  No Bid No Bid 725.00$     36,250.00$    675.00$    33,750.00$  410.00$    20,500.00$                     300.00$    15,000.00$  
#0-11 15 Gallon Tree - Monterey Oak Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 237.50$     4,750.00$    No Bid No Bid 475.00$     9,500.00$      475.00$    9,500.00$    235.00$    4,700.00$                       200.00$    4,000.00$    
#0-12 Tree Sapling - Monterey Oak '- 100 Each 50.00$       5,000.00$    No Bid No Bid 1,100.00$  110,000.00$  55.00$      5,500.00$    4.75$         475.00$                          30.00$      3,000.00$    
#0-13 45 Gallon Tree - Cedar Elm Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 906.25$     18,125.00$  595.00$       11,900.00$     1,100.00$  22,000.00$    775.00$    15,500.00$  610.00$    12,200.00$                     550.00$    11,000.00$  
#0-14 30 Gallon Tree - Cedar Elm Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 50 Each 468.75$     23,437.50$  450.00$       22,500.00$     1,100.00$  55,000.00$    675.00$    33,750.00$  410.00$    20,500.00$                     300.00$    15,000.00$  
#0-15 15 Gallon Tree - Cedar Elm Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 237.50$     4,750.00$    No Bid No Bid 400.00$     8,000.00$      475.00$    9,500.00$    235.00$    4,700.00$                       200.00$    4,000.00$    
#0-16 Tree Sapling - Cedar Elm '- 100 Each 50.00$       5,000.00$    7.95$           795.00$          1,100.00$  110,000.00$  55.00$      5,500.00$    4.75$         475.00$                          30.00$      3,000.00$    
#0-17 45 Gallon Tree - Bald Cypress Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 906.25$     18,125.00$  595.00$       11,900.00$     1,100.00$  22,000.00$    775.00$    15,500.00$  585.00$    11,700.00$                     550.00$    11,000.00$  
#0-18 30 Gallon Tree - Bald Cypress Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 50 Each 468.75$     23,437.50$  450.00$       22,500.00$     750.00$     37,500.00$    675.00$    33,750.00$  390.00$    19,500.00$                     300.00$    15,000.00$  
#0-19 15 Gallon Tree - Bald Cypress Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 237.50$     4,750.00$    No Bid No Bid 580.00$     11,600.00$    475.00$    9,500.00$    235.00$    4,700.00$                       200.00$    4,000.00$    
#0-20 Tree Sapling - Bald Cypress '- 100 Each 50.00$       5,000.00$    7.95$           795.00$          725.00$     72,500.00$    55.00$      5,500.00$    4.75$         475.00$                          30.00$      3,000.00$    
#0-21 45 Gallon Tree - Texas/Eastern Red Bud Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 906.25$     18,125.00$  595.00$       11,900.00$     880.00$     17,600.00$    775.00$    15,500.00$  625.00$    12,500.00$                     550.00$    11,000.00$  
#0-22 30 Gallon Tree - Texas/Eastern Red Bud Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 50 Each 468.75$     23,437.50$  450.00$       22,500.00$     700.00$     35,000.00$    675.00$    33,750.00$  410.00$    20,500.00$                     300.00$    15,000.00$  
#0-23 15 Gallon Tree - Texas/Eastern Red Bud Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 237.50$     4,750.00$    No Bid No Bid 580.00$     11,600.00$    475.00$    9,500.00$    235.00$    4,700.00$                       200.00$    4,000.00$    
#0-24 45 Gallon Tree - Mexican Plum Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 906.25$     18,125.00$  No Bid No Bid 725.00$     14,500.00$    775.00$    15,500.00$  685.00$    13,700.00$                     600.00$    12,000.00$  
#0-25 30 Gallon Tree - Mexican Plum Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 50 Each 468.75$     23,437.50$  No Bid No Bid 625.00$     31,250.00$    675.00$    33,750.00$  410.00$    20,500.00$                     300.00$    15,000.00$  
#0-26 15 Gallon Tree - Mexican Plum Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 237.50$     4,750.00$    No Bid No Bid 490.00$     9,800.00$      475.00$    9,500.00$    250.00$    5,000.00$                       200.00$    4,000.00$    
#0-27 45 Gallon Tree -  Mexican Sycamore Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 906.25$     18,125.00$  No Bid No Bid 680.00$     13,600.00$    775.00$    15,500.00$  675.00$    13,500.00$                     550.00$    11,000.00$  
#0-28 30 Gallon Tree -  Mexican Sycamore Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 50 Each 468.75$     23,437.50$  No Bid No Bid 580.00$     29,000.00$    675.00$    33,750.00$  410.00$    20,500.00$                     300.00$    15,000.00$  
#0-29 15 Gallon Tree -  Mexican Sycamore Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 237.50$     4,750.00$    No Bid No Bid 480.00$     9,600.00$      475.00$    9,500.00$    250.00$    5,000.00$                       200.00$    4,000.00$    
#0-30 Tree Sapling - Mexican Sycamore '- 100 Each 50.00$       5,000.00$    No Bid No Bid 900.00$     90,000.00$    55.00$      5,500.00$    4.75$         475.00$                          30.00$      3,000.00$    
#0-31 45 Gallon Tree - Shumard Oak Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 906.25$     18,125.00$  595.00$       11,900.00$     725.00$     14,500.00$    775.00$    15,500.00$  595.00$    11,900.00$                     550.00$    11,000.00$  
#0-32 30 Gallon Tree - Shumard Oak Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 50 Each 468.75$     23,437.50$  450.00$       22,500.00$     625.00$     31,250.00$    675.00$    33,750.00$  410.00$    20,500.00$                     300.00$    15,000.00$  
#0-33 15 Gallon Tree - Shumard Oak Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 237.50$     4,750.00$    No Bid No Bid 525.00$     10,500.00$    475.00$    9,500.00$    235.00$    4,700.00$                       200.00$    4,000.00$    
#0-34 Tree Sapling - Shumard Oak '- 100 Each 50.00$       5,000.00$    7.95$           795.00$          725.00$     72,500.00$    55.00$      5,500.00$    4.75$         475.00$                          30.00$      3,000.00$    
#0-35 45 Gallon Tree -  Bur Oak Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 906.25$     18,125.00$  595.00$       11,900.00$     1,100.00$  22,000.00$    775.00$    15,500.00$  595.00$    11,900.00$                     550.00$    11,000.00$  
#0-36 30 Gallon Tree -  Bur Oak Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 50 Each 468.75$     23,437.50$  450.00$       22,500.00$     880.00$     44,000.00$    675.00$    33,750.00$  410.00$    20,500.00$                     300.00$    15,000.00$  
#0-37 15 Gallon Tree -  Bur Oak Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 237.50$     4,750.00$    No Bid No Bid 680.00$     13,600.00$    475.00$    9,500.00$    235.00$    4,700.00$                       200.00$    4,000.00$    
#0-38 Tree Sapling -  Bur Oak '- 100 Each 50.00$       5,000.00$    7.95$           795.00$          980.00$     98,000.00$    55.00$      5,500.00$    4.75$         475.00$                          30.00$      3,000.00$    
#0-39 45 Gallon Tree -  Eastern Red Cedar Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 906.25$     18,125.00$  595.00$       11,900.00$     725.00$     14,500.00$    775.00$    15,500.00$  595.00$    11,900.00$                     550.00$    11,000.00$  
#0-40 30 Gallon Tree -  Eastern Red Cedar Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 50 Each 468.75$     23,437.50$  450.00$       22,500.00$     625.00$     31,250.00$    675.00$    33,750.00$  390.00$    19,500.00$                     300.00$    15,000.00$  
#0-41 15 Gallon Tree -  Eastern Red Cedar Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 237.50$     4,750.00$    No Bid No Bid 525.00$     10,500.00$    475.00$    9,500.00$    235.00$    4,700.00$                       200.00$    4,000.00$    
#0-43 45 Gallon Tree -  American Elm Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 906.25$     18,125.00$  No Bid No Bid 725.00$     14,500.00$    775.00$    15,500.00$  595.00$    11,900.00$                     550.00$    11,000.00$  
#0-44 30 Gallon Tree -   American Elm Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 50 Each 468.75$     23,437.50$  No Bid No Bid 625.00$     31,250.00$    675.00$    33,750.00$  390.00$    19,500.00$                     300.00$    15,000.00$  
#0-45 15 Gallon Tree -   American Elm Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 237.50$     4,750.00$    No Bid No Bid 525.00$     10,500.00$    475.00$    9,500.00$    250.00$    5,000.00$                       200.00$    4,000.00$    
#0-46 Tree Sapling - American Elm '- 100 Each 50.00$       5,000.00$    No Bid No Bid 1,100.00$  110,000.00$  55.00$      5,500.00$    4.75$         475.00$                          30.00$      3,000.00$    
#0-47 45 Gallon Tree -  Caddo Maple Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 906.25$     18,125.00$  No Bid No Bid 750.00$     15,000.00$    775.00$    15,500.00$  615.00$    12,300.00$                     650.00$    13,000.00$  
#0-48 30 Gallon Tree -  Caddo Maple Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 50 Each 468.75$     23,437.50$  No Bid No Bid 650.00$     32,500.00$    675.00$    33,750.00$  435.00$    21,750.00$                     400.00$    20,000.00$  
#0-49 15 Gallon Tree -  Caddo Maple Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 237.50$     4,750.00$    No Bid No Bid 550.00$     11,000.00$    475.00$    9,500.00$    245.00$    4,900.00$                       250.00$    5,000.00$    
#0-51 45 Gallon Tree -  Pecan Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 906.25$     18,125.00$  595.00$       11,900.00$     780.00$     15,600.00$    775.00$    15,500.00$  750.00$    15,000.00$                     600.00$    12,000.00$  
#0-52 30 Gallon Tree -  Pecan Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 50 Each 468.75$     23,437.50$  450.00$       22,500.00$     680.00$     34,000.00$    675.00$    33,750.00$  435.00$    21,750.00$                     300.00$    15,000.00$  
#0-53 15 Gallon Tree -  Pecan Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 237.50$     4,750.00$    No Bid No Bid 580.00$     11,600.00$    475.00$    9,500.00$    260.00$    5,200.00$                       200.00$    4,000.00$    
#0-54 Tree Saplings - Pecan '- 100 Each 50.00$       5,000.00$    7.95$           795.00$          725.00$     72,500.00$    55.00$      5,500.00$    4.75$         475.00$                          30.00$      3,000.00$    
#0-55 45 Gallon Tree -  TX Ash Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 906.25$     18,125.00$  No Bid No Bid 680.00$     13,600.00$    775.00$    15,500.00$  595.00$    11,900.00$                     550.00$    11,000.00$  
#0-56 30 Gallon Tree -  TX Ash Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 50 Each 468.75$     23,437.50$  No Bid No Bid 580.00$     29,000.00$    675.00$    33,750.00$  410.00$    20,500.00$                     300.00$    15,000.00$  
#0-57 15 Gallon Tree -  TX Ash Includes installing, stabilizing, initial watering, and 1 year warranty. 20 Each 237.50$     4,750.00$    No Bid No Bid 490.00$     9,800.00$      475.00$    9,500.00$    235.00$    4,700.00$                       200.00$    4,000.00$    
#0-58 Tree Saplings -  TX Ash '- 100 Each 50.00$       5,000.00$    No Bid No Bid 900.00$     90,000.00$    55.00$      5,500.00$    4.75$         475.00$                          30.00$      3,000.00$    

RFB #25-116-A Annual Contract for Tree Supply
Wednesday, September 10, 2025

Texas Tree Surgeons
749,692.50$                      315,165.00$                            1,867,650.00$                     944,500.00$                      569,525.00$                                         493,000.00$                      

ABH Pros, LLP Fannin Tree Farm Sales, LLC Greenville Enterprises llc Qultek Consultants, Inc.
Texas Garden & Horticulture dba 
Lone Star Products and Materials
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