Denton Central Appraisal District & (940) 349-3800
3911 Morse Street
Denton, TX 76208 @ www.dentoncad.com

12/19/2023

288838

SMITH, BENJAMIN M

2460 SUNDERLAND LN
LEWISVILLE, TX 75067-6716

RE: Residential Homestead

Property ID: 288838
Property Address: 2460 SUNDERLAND LN, LEWISVILLE, TX 75067-6716

STATEMENT OF FACTS IN REGARD TO REQUEST TO WAIVE PENALTY AND INTEREST

05/01/2023 — Denton CAD updated the ownership & address per deed 2023-29658 which was recorded by
the Denton County Clerk 03/24/2023 with the address 2460 Sunderland Ln_Lewisville TX 75067-6716.

07/12/2023 - Denton CAD received return mail for the previous owner indicating the mailing address should be
8524 Haverhill, The Colony TX 75056-5167 and Denton CAD updated the mailing address to 8524
i e Colo| 75056-5186

08/08/2023 - Denton CAD processed a homestead application for Benjamin Smith and failed to update the
mailing address.

02/01/2024 — Denton CAD was informed of the incorrect address change and corrected the mailing address to
2460 derland Ln isville 75067

Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions.

Respectfully,

Jacob Stvartak

Customer Service Supervisor
Denton Central Appraisal District
jacob.stvartak@dentoncad.com
(940) 349-3820



From: Michelle French

To: Mark Burroughs; Matthew Tepper; Craig Morgan; Gilbert Bragg
Cc: Brittany Taylor

Subject: RE: Information on Your Request {474891} - Acct 288838
Date: Monday, February 12, 2024 1:51:00 PM

Attachments: image001.png

Thanks so much, Mark!

Michelle French
Denton County Tax Assessor Collector
940-349-3500

“You are never too old to set another goal or to dream a new dream” — C.S. Lewis

“There is incredible value in being of service to others.” Elizabeth Berg

From: Mark Burroughs <attyburroughs@dentonlawyer.com>

Sent: Monday, February 12, 2024 12:01 PM

To: Michelle French <Michelle.French@dentoncounty.gov>; Matthew Tepper
<Matthew.Tepper@mvbalaw.com>; Craig Morgan <Craig.Morgan@mvbalaw.com>; Gilbert Bragg
<Gilbert.Bragg@mvbalaw.com>

Cc: Brittany Taylor <Brittany.Taylor@mvbalaw.com>

Subject: RE: Information on Your Request {474891} - Acct 288838

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments

unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. Never enter your password or other

sensitive information on linked web pages contained in emails unless you are certain the web pages are
safe. If you have questions or need assistance, please contact the Help Desk.

| agree with your and Gil’s conclusion.

MAB

Mark Burroughs | Shareholder
Sawko & Burroughs, P.C.
1172 Bent Qaks Drive

Denton, Texas 76210

(940) 382-4357 telephone
(940) 591-0991 facsimile
www.dentonlawyer.com

Consumer Debt Collection Notice:
You are hereby informed that this e-mail and any subsequent e-mails may be an attempt to collect a



From: Gilbert Bragg

To: Michelle French; Matthew Tepper; Craig Morgan; "Mark Burroughs"
Cc: Brittany Tavlor; Gilbert Braga
Subject: RE: Information on Your Request {474891} - Acct 288838
Date: . Friday, February 9, 2024 1:39:10 PM
Attachments: image002.png
image003.png

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments

unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. Never enter your password or other

sensitive information on linked web pages contained in emails unless you are certain the web pages are
safe. If you have questions or need assistance, please contact the Help Desk.

Michelle,

| concur with your observation that the CAD Statement of Facts supports the request for waiver.

Regards,

Gil
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Gilbert T. Bragg | Partner

E-mail : gilbert.bragg@mybalaw.com
Main : 512-323-3200
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From: Michelle French <Michelle.French@dentoncounty.gov>

Sent: Friday, February 9, 2024 12:35 PM

To: Matthew Tepper <Matthew.Tepper @mvbalaw.com>; Craig Morgan
<Craig.Morgan@mvbalaw.com>; Gilbert Bragg <Gilbert.Bragg@mvbalaw.com>; 'Mark Burroughs
<attyburroughs@dentonlawyer.com>

Cc: Brittany Taylor <Brittany.Taylor@mvbalaw.com>

Subject: FW: Information on Your Request {474891} - Acct 288838

E This message was sent from outside The Firm

Hello everyone,



consumer debt as defined in the Texas Finance Code and the Fair Debt Collection Practices Act. Any
information provided in the course of this e-mail, subsequent e-mails, or any replies thereafter, may be used
for the purpose of collecting a consumer debt or debts. Any purported amounts stated herein may not be full
and final and any charges or fees asserted herein are subject to proper judicial review, and award thereof
may be subject to judicial discretion. If you are represented by legal counsel in regard to the consumer debt
potentially asserted herein, please inform this office immediately, and remit all past, current, and future
communications to your legal counsel. Upon written request from you, we will cease all communication
pertaining to the debt potentially asserted herein, unless the communication is for the purpose(s) of: (1)
advising you that collection attempts are being terminated; (2) informing you that our client or clients may
invoke specified remedies which are ordinarily invoked by a debt collector or creditor, or; (3) notifying you
that our client intends to invoke a specified remedy.

Internet Disclosure and Dissemination Notice:

You are instructed that this email is intended only for the use of the party to which it is addressed and that
this email may contain information that is privileged, confidential, or protected by law. If you are not the
intended recipient you are hereby notified that any dissemination, copying or distribution of this email or its
contents is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please notify us immediately by
replying to the message and deleting it from your computer. Internet communications are not assured to be
secure or clear of inaccuracies as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, destroyed, arrive late or
incomplete, or contain viruses. Therefore, we do not accept responsibility for any errors or omissions that
are present in this email, or any attachment, that have arisen as a result of e-mail transmission. This e-mail
communication does not reflect any intention by Sawko & Burroughs, P.C., the sender, or any client or
principal of any of them to conduct a transaction, make an agreement, or enter into any contract by
electronic means and nothing contained in this message or any attachment shall constitute a contract or
electronic signature under the Electronic Signatures in Global and National Commerce Act, any version of
the Uniform Electronic Transactions Act or any other statute governing electronic transactions or electronic
signatures.

From: Michelle French <Michelle French@dentoncounty.gov>

Sent: Friday, February 9, 2024 12:35 PM

To: Matthew Tepper <Matthew.Tepper@mybalaw.com>; Craig Morgan
<Craig.Morgan@mybalaw.com>; Gilbert Bragg <Gilbert.Bragg@mvbalaw.com>; Mark Burroughs
<attyburroughs@dentonlawyer.com>

Cc: Brittany Taylor <Brittany. Taylor@mvbalaw.com>

Subject: FW: Information on Your Request {474891} - Acct 288838

Hello everyone,

We have this request for P & | waiver. The CAD has issued the attached statement of facts
regarding this account. It appears that this is a valid waiver. However as usual, | would tike you
to take a look. If you agree, please send me a recommendation.
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Thanks!

Michelle French
Denton County Tax Assessor Collector
940-349-3500

“You are never too old to set another goal or to dream a new dream” — C.S. Lewis

“There is incredible value in being of service to others.” Elizabeth Berg

From: Alicia Martinez <Alicia.Martinez@dentoncounty.gov>

Sent: Friday, February 9, 2024 8:37 AM

To: Michelle French <Michelle.French@dentoncounty.gov>

Cc: Tax Financial <Tax.Financial@dentoncounty.gov>

Subject: FW: Information on Your Request {474891} - Acct 288838

Michelle,

Can you please review this request for a waiver of penalty and interest. Attached is a statement
of fact from DCAD.

Please let me know if anything is needed for review and determination.

Sincerely,
Wlicia Madi



Senior Supervisor of Financial Department for
Michelle French, Denton County Tax Assessor/Collector

From: Property Tax <Property. Tax@dentoncounty.gov>
Sent: Thursday, February 8, 2024 3:36 PM

To: Tax Financial <Tax.Financial@dentoncounty.gov>
Subject: FW: Information on Your Request {474891} - Acct 288838

Please see attached statement from customer that was supplied to them from DCAD that they
told the customer to present to us.

Thank you,

Katie Jo Kelch

Processing Department Supervisor
For Michelle French

Denton County Tax Assessor-Collector

From: Ben (NN

Sent: Friday, February 2, 2024 8:59 AM

To: Property Tax <Property.Tax@dentoncounty.gov>

Cc: Ben Smith <ps85238@gmail.com>

Subject: FW: Information on Your Request {474891} - Acct 288838

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments ]
unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. Never enter your password or other
sensitive information on linked web pages contained in emails unless you are certain the web pages are
safe. If you have questions or need assistance, please contact the Help Desk.

Dear Sir or Madam,

Please review the attached statement of facts. | am requesting a call back and a waiver of penalty and
interest.

Regards,

Ben Smith
(210) 904-6141

Caterpillar: Confidential Green




