
MATRIX

Abescape Group LLC

Arlington, TX

ZONES 1, 2, 3, 4 & 5

ZONE 1

30 25.17

15 12.17

15 9.50

10 3.00

30 18.35

0.00

100 POINTS 68.18

$513,612.10

ZONE 2

30 25.17

15 12.17

15 9.50

10 3.00

30 16.35

0.00

100 POINTS 66.18

$473,339.50

ZONE 3

30 25.17

15 12.17

15 9.50

10 3.00

30 16.66

0.00

100 POINTS 66.50

$506,334.22

ZONE 4 (Creek Channel)

30 25.17

15 12.17

15 9.50

10 3.00

30 12.91

0.00

BONUS POINTS FOR FUEL EQUIPMENT (5%, 10% 

CITY OF LEWISVILLE

PURCHASING DIVISION

RFP # 20-13-A

MOWING SERVICES

EQUIPMENT

PREVIOUS MUNICIPAL EXPERIENCE

PREVIOUS EXPERIENCE

NUMBER OF DAYS TO COMPLETE A CYCLE

PRICE

NUMBER OF DAYS TO COMPLETE A CYCLE

TOTALS

EQUIPMENT

PREVIOUS MUNICIPAL EXPERIENCE

PREVIOUS EXPERIENCE

NUMBER OF DAYS TO COMPLETE A CYCLE

PRICE

BONUS POINTS FOR FUEL EQUIPMENT (5%, 10% 

TOTALS

EQUIPMENT

PREVIOUS MUNICIPAL EXPERIENCE

PREVIOUS EXPERIENCE

PRICE

BONUS POINTS FOR FUEL EQUIPMENT (5%, 10% 

TOTALS

EQUIPMENT

PREVIOUS MUNICIPAL EXPERIENCE

PREVIOUS EXPERIENCE

NUMBER OF DAYS TO COMPLETE A CYCLE

PRICE

BONUS POINTS FOR FUEL EQUIPMENT (5%, 10% 



100 POINTS 62.75

$116,688.00

ZONE 5 (I-35)

30 25.17

15 12.17

15 9.50

10 3.00

30 13.53

0.00

100 POINTS 63.36

$100,320.00

PREVIOUS MUNICIPAL EXPERIENCE

TOTALS

EQUIPMENT

PREVIOUS EXPERIENCE

NUMBER OF DAYS TO COMPLETE A CYCLE

PRICE

BONUS POINTS FOR FUEL EQUIPMENT (5%, 10% 

TOTALS



Carruthers Landscape Mgt. Good Earth Corp. High Quality Landscape Services

Dallas, TX Dallas, TX Dallas, TX

ZONES 1, 2, 3, & 5 ZONES 1, 2, 3, 4 & 5 ZONES 1, 2 & 3

26.67 28.33 4.00

14.00 12.50 10.80

14.33 11.67 8.83

8.50 8.75 9.20

30.00 15.48 23.48

3.00 1.55 0.00

96.50 78.28 56.31

$314,180.00 $608,914.00 $401,445.65

26.67 28.33 4.00

14.00 12.50 10.80

14.33 11.67 8.83

8.50 8.75 9.20

30.00 13.80 21.92

3.00 1.38 0.00

96.50 76.43 54.75

$257,980.00 $560,670.00 $353,138.50

26.67 28.33 4.00

14.00 12.50 10.80

14.33 11.67 8.83

8.50 8.75 9.20

30.00 16.47 22.09

3.00 1.65 0.00

96.50 79.37 54.92

$281,240.00 $512,142.00 $381,996.50

NO BID 28.33 NO BID

12.50

11.67

8.75

30.00

3.00



94.25

$50,232.00

26.67 28.33 NO BID

14.00 12.50

14.33 11.67

8.50 8.75

11.78 30.00

1.18 3.00

76.46 94.25

$115,200.00 $45,236.00



K&B Ag Services Mortgage Contracting Services Yellowstone Landscape

Ennis, TX Lewisville, TX Dallas, Tx

ZONES 4 & 5 ZONES 1, 2, 3, 4 & 5 ZONES 1, 2, 3, 4 & 5

NO BID 22.00 27.17

8.50 13.33

9.00 11.50

0.00 9.17

24.67 28.26

0.00 2.83

64.17 92.26

$382,025.00 $333,479.13

NO BID 22.00 27.17

8.50 13.33

9.00 11.50

0.00 9.17

21.59 20.72

0.00 2.07

61.09 83.96

$358,400.00 $373,512.22

NO BID 22.00 27.17

8.50 13.33

9.00 11.50

0.00 9.17

19.09 21.09

0.00 2.11

58.59 84.36

$441,875.00 $400,129.76

22.00 22.00 27.17

2.83 8.50 13.33

8.00 9.00 11.50

9.50 0.00 9.17

11.67 16.31 29.14

0.00 0.00 2.91



54.00 55.81 93.22

$129,186.24 $92,400.00 $51,708.00

22.00 NO BID 27.17

2.83 13.33

8.00 11.50

9.50 9.17

22.48 16.51

0.00 1.65

64.82 79.33

$60,360.00 $82,179.60


